

Visayas State University Bids and Awards Committee (BAC)

Visca, Baybay, Leyte, 6521-A Philippines

BAC RESOLUTION Declaring the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid and Recommending Approval

BAC RESOLUTION NO. 01 Series of 2015

WHEREAS, the VISAYAS STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Apply for Eligibility and to Bid for the Supply and Delivery of IT Equipment and Accessories in the PhilGEPS and posted the same in the VSU Website's transparency seal and in conspicuous places within the premises of the Visayas State University for 14 calendar days;

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisement, Five (5) bidders purchased bidding documents and submitted applications for eligibility and joined the bidding for the said IT Equipment on 13 April 2015;

WHEREAS, after checking the eligibility requirements, the BAC declared that all bidders *passed* the preliminary examination of bids;

WHEREAS, upon detailed evaluation of the technical component, all the five (5) bidders passed the technical requirements.

WHEREAS, after all the bids were tabulated and ranked, the BAC identified the Lowest calculated Bid (LCB) for each item as shown in the attached Abstract of Quotation with the highlighted bid price/offer getting the LCB;

NOW, THEREFORE, based on the above premises, we the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE as it is RESOLVED:

- a) To declare **PC Specialist**, as the Bidders with the **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid** for item numbers 3, and 11;
- b) To declare **EMCOR**, **INC**. as the Bidder with the **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid** for item numbers 4 and 17;
- c) To declare **JOEBZ** as the Bidder with the **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid** for item numbers 1, 2, 5, 7, 12, 13, 14, 16 and 18;
- d) To declare **COMPUSPEC** as the Bidder with **the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid** for item numbers 8,15, and 19;
- e) To declare **NGKHAI** as the Bidder with the **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid** for item numbers 6, 9, and 10; and

f) To recommend for approval by the President of the Visayas State University the foregoing findings.

MARIO VALENZON

BAC Member

BAC Member

RESOLVED, at the Office of the Vice President for Administration and Finance, Conference Room, this 13th day of April 2015.

//gm open

BAC Member

Achan-ampac LOUELLA C. AMPAC

BAC Member

ALAN B. LORETO Provisional Member

> ROBERTO C. GUARTE BAC Chairman

JØSE L. BACUSMO President

Republic of the Philippines VISAYAS STATE UNIVERSITY

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSALS

oped on April 13, 2015, for furnishing IT Equipment and Accessories, for Visavas, State, University

Item	APTICLES AND SPECIFICATIONS	OTV	UNIT	NAME OF FIRM OR DEALER										
No.		ui i	UNIT	Ormoc PC	Specialist	EMCOR	J	loebz	CompuSpec	Ng/	Khai			
	For VSU-VLHS									47 400 04				
1	Compact, Country	17	set	15,935.00		17,000.00	14,880.00		15,828,00	17,469.91	4-			
	- Intel Core (3				<u></u>		/				4			
	- Gigabyte/ASUS H81 Board				/	6 8					4			
	- 2 gb RAM				<u> </u>						1_			
	- 500 gb Hard Disk Drive				<u> </u>						1			
	- 15.6 LED Monitor							7			4			
	- Genius Keyboard, USB				<u> </u>						4			
	- Genius Mouse, PS2				<u>'</u>						4			
	- AVR Boost brand	A 13	1	9		1 - 100000000		Secure brand	- PVI PP	5 007 00	4			
2	24 Port Switch	2	unit	2,520.00	<u>'</u>	8,500.00	4,980,00		7,540.00	5,885.00	4			
		- E		0			TP Link SG10	024 Gigabit			4			
1119	For DCST		19.15				12 840 40		10.005.00	40 507 54	1			
3	San Paris Country	15	set	17,870.00	<u> </u>	19,500.00	17,980.00	P	18,925.00	19,567.51	4			
	- Core i3 Processor			1	ſ'						4			
	- Gigabyte H81 Socket 1150 Motherboard	The Tay									1			
0 7	- 4 GB RAM, Kingston	21 10 17									4			
	- Harddisk, 1TB, Western Digital										4			
	- 18" LED Monitor, SAMSUNG										4			
	- Genius Keyboard, USB, Genius Mouse, PS2	7		5 0				/ / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / /			1			
	- AVR Boost brand										1			
4	Notebook - Asus X450LD-WX007H or its equivalent	1	unit	and the second of the second o		31,000.00	34,280.00		34,867.00	32,450.00	1			
	- Intel Core i5 4200U 1.6GHz			WX012H		/		[1			
	- Processor/ 4GB DDR3 Memory/500GB					X455LD-					1			
	- HDD/14.0" 16.9 HD (1366x768) LED	ATT				WX012H		4 = = 3	100000000000000000000000000000000000000		4			
	- Backlit/NVIDIA GeForce GT820M 2GB													
	- DDR3 VRAM/ Super-Multi DVD/802.11bgn	Til D						1	1					
	- WiFi + BT/Card Reader/HD Webcam/HDMI / Windows 8.1	A	1	2	4		FITTING TO SERVICE							
5	APC Back-UPS 650VA, 490 watts or its equiv	8	units	2,250.00	BX-650LI-MS	6,500.00	6,495.00		6,588.00	6,600.00	+			
6	APC Smart UPS for Server 3000VA or its equiv	1	unit	70,495.00	SVA 30001	No Bid	65,880,00		66,000.00	62,700.00				
-	At a children of a late of the control of the contr	-	-	-						1				

item	A ARTICLES AND EDECIFICATIONS	lan		NAME OF FIRM OR DEALER										
No.	ABTICLES AND SOUTHICATIONS	div	UNIT	Ormoc PC Specialis	list EMCOR		Joebz	CompuSpec		No	gKh			
-	For DPM										4			
7	PRINTER, EPSON 350, 3 in 1(Print, Copy, Scan) or equiv	Alle		11,000.00	3,700.00	8,880.00		9,405.00		2,959.00	-			
	Cartridge: Black and Color			L355	HP 1515	1		The state of the s		Brother 1100	1			
	Computer accessories:										1			
8	APC Back-UPS 650VA, 400 watts or its equivalent	3	pos	Company of the property of the company of the compa	6,500.00	6,495.00		6,426.00	BX850CI-MS	2,013.00	4			
				BX-650LI-MS				1			1			
9	Mouse	2	pes	220.00	No Bid	230.00	4	253.50		159.90	4			
	- PANCOCK				0					*				
10	Mouse Pad	2	pcs	25.00	No Bid	70.00		38.50		22.00	A			
11	Computer, Desktop	3	set	17,870.00	17,980.00	17,980.00		18,775.80		51,157.38	É			
-	- Core I3 Processor			/							1			
	- Gigabyte H61 Socket 1150 Motherboard		1						-		1			
	- 4 GB RAM, Kingston										,			
	- Harddisk, 1TB, Western Digital		_								ŕ			
	-18' LED Monitor, SAMSUNG		+								7			
	- Genius Keylopard, USB		+-				1				×			
	- Genius Mouse, PS2		+-						4		*			
	- AVR Boost brand		+-							+	ř			
	For RCCRDC									4 2 2 3 3	ĺ			
12		2	units	62,650.00	59,000.00	58,880.00	Asus N551JK-	60,375.00		59,400.00	ľ			
-	Processor: Intel Core i7-4700HQ 2.4GHz; Screen: 15.6"	-	Minne	-	-	-	CN-016H	==)		-	ř			
-		1	-				Sit state		1	1	r			
_	Widescreen, 1920 x 1080; Memory: 8GB DDR3 (4GB x 2);	1	+	-		4	+				-			
_	Storage:1TB HDD, 5400RPM; Graphics:NVIDIA GeForce GT75	SA PROPERTY.	1				1				7			
	Operation System: Windows 8 64-Bit; Communications: 802.11						-		-	-	ļ			
	b/g/n WLAN, Bluetooth 4.0; Battery: 59Whrs, 4000MAH, 4	4S1P	400				1-1-1-1			1	,			
	4-cell Li-ion Polymer Battery Pack; MS Office 2014	4_'	<u> </u>			17.150.07		20 424 60	2012	25 050 76	ľ			
13		11	set	39,920.00	No Bid	37,880.00		36,174.60	MS Office 2013	60,050.76	1			
	Processor: Intel Core i5-3470 3.2GHz, 64 bit Quad-Core	4_'	1			- 1	Paper Lic Educ		4-3		7			
	Processor; RAM: 8GB DDR3 1333; Hard drive: 1TB 7200RPM;									4	ř			
	Operating System: Windows 8.1; Monitor: LED LCD 18.5* widescreen;	6									r			
	UPS: APC 650 VA; A4 TECH USB MOUSE & KEYBOARD	1 '									,			
	MS Office 2014		1						4	10	F			
							1		<u> </u>	4				
		1_'	/	-					4	1	-			
											_			
		1	/							45.2	ľ			

Item	ARTICLES AND SPECIFICATIONS LCD PROJECTOR, Epson EB-X18 Projector 3000 Lumens or its e		0.800	NAM. JF FIRM OR DEALER										
No.		20000	unit	Ormoc PC Specialist		EMCOR NAM.			Joebz Joebz		CompuSpec		NgKha	
14				30,800.00		29,000.00		28,185.00		30,850.00	**********	29,590.00		
	XGA Projector with free 70"x70" Tripod Projector Screen				Ü			1						
	LCD Panel: 0.55 inch with MLA (D8); Resolution: XGA,1024 x 768,4:3	3											\vdash	
	Projection Ratio:1.48 - 1.77;1; Lens:Optical ;Projection Size:30" - 300"				-								1	
	Focus: Manual; USB Display Function: 3 in 1: Image / Mouse / Sound							0.5				ş .		
	Energy Use: 270 Watt, 201 Watt (economy), 0.28 Watt (standby);													
	Dimensions: 297 x 234 x 77 mm (Width x Depth x Height)												1	
15	Digital Camera, SONY DIGITAL SLT-A77VQ 24.3 Mega	1	unit	45,200.00		No Bid		88,895.00		87,750.00		86,128,90		
	Pixel Camera with SAL 1650 Lens, or its equivalent			ILCE-6000L						1		Sony ILCA-7		
	Carnera Type: Interchangeable lens digital carnera with built-in flash;									per specs			T	
	Lens Used: Sony A-mount lens, Minolta and Konica Minolta AF lenses	ē -											\vdash	
	Sensor: 23.5 x 15.6mm (APS-C type), Exmor APS HD CMOS sensor												-	
	with RGB primary colour filter, LCD Monitor.3.0-inch(100% field of view	v),						1000					-	
	921,600-dot TFT, Xtra Fine LCD with TruBlack technology;					-				2 1 1 1 1			-	
	Battery: Rechargeable battery pack NP-FM500H.													
	For CHED-COD			Town State Up										
16	Computer, Desktop, Intel Core i7	3	sets	65,000.00		No Bid		34,175.00	Core 17-4790	36,652.00		37,181.09		
	3.2GHz, 8GB, DDR3-1600MHz Memory, 1TB 7200RPM	-			ā .		-3-1	1	Gigabyte H81				\vdash	
	SATA HDD, Supermutti DVDRW, NVIDIA GeForce GT720								(
	2GB DDR3 Video Graphics, 7-in-1 Media Card Reader,						V							
Ţή	Wired KB & Mouse, with 20-inch Monitor								AOC Monitor				\vdash	
17	Operating System (OS) Windows St. 8.1 with Disk Installer	4	units	4,370.00		4,100.00		4,150.00		4,373.25		4,345.00		
200					9	V								
18	Licensed Microsoft Office 2010 Professional with Disk Installer	4	units	10,235.00		No Bid		4,495.00	Paper Lie Ofe	9,401,00		10,152.77		
			Home	& Office 2013	APAC			-	Std Educ		/			
19	APC Back-UPS 650VA, 400 watts or its equivalent	6	units	2,250.00	BX-650LI-MS	No Bid		6,495.00		6,426.00	BX650CI-MS	2,013.00	B	
$\overline{}$										1				

WE HEREBY CERTIFY: 1. That we opened the bids publicly in response to a public advertisement copy of which is filed herewith

2. That all the entries above are true and correct.

COMMITTEE ON BIRS AND AWARDS

ROBERTO C. GUARTE

LOURDES B. CANO Regular Member LOUELLA C. AMPAC

LOUELLA C. AMPA(Regular Member MARIO LILIO P. VALENZOÑA Regular Member

LOLITO C. BESTIL Regular Member

ALAN B. LORETO

Provisional Member

WINSTON M. TABADA

TWG, I.T.